BYRAM HILLS SCHOOL DISTRICT
10 Tripp Lane, Armonk, NY 10504
Office: 914-273-4198 X 5938 Fax: 914-273-4199

July 11, 2023

Ocean Janitorial Supply, Inc.
2775 Sunrise Highway
Islip Terrace, NY 11752

Re: Janitorial Supplies Bid 23/24 - 02

Dear Gina Manolis

I am pleased to inform you that the Board of Education has awarded you Two Hundred Twenty
Two (222) janitorial supply items as highlighted and at the Unit Prices on the attached bid
submitted by your firm.

The total award amount will be based on the quantities ordered from July 1 through October 31,
2023 at the Unit Prices your firm submitted. The Byram Hills School District reserves the right
to renew this Contract for up to two additional four-month periods from November 1, 2023
through February 28, 2024 and from March 1, 2024 though June 30, 2024. Bid renewal shall be
subject to any adjustments or agreement between the parties.

A Purchase Order for these items will be sent to you shortly.

I look forward to working with your company in the coming year.

Sincerely,

Wil pun B Wassen

William R. Wasser
Purchasing Agent

Attachment



Byram Hills School District Bid No. 23/24 - 02 for Janitorial Supplies

Tuly 1, 2023 - Oct 31, 2023

OCEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

[tem

*** All quantities are per
each item in the Description. Please

indicate the shipping
Quantity Per Package and the Unit

Price of

item in the columns to
right of Qty as well as the Total Price.

*%k*

** Additonal shipping and
handling costs within the State of New York
to counties

other than Westchester, Putnam, Rockland,
Orange and Dutchess = 5%

(Pricing for items shipped to Westchester,
Putnam, Rockland, Orange and
Dutchess

counties to include cost of shipping in prices
submitted
for below items)

ALL ITEMS LISTED
BELOW WITH A SPECIFIC
BRAND NAME ARE TO BE
QUOTED AS IS OR

EQUIVALENT. IF

QUOTING AN EQUIVALENT, A
SAMPLE OF THE ITEM MUST BE
SUBMITTED

TO

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price




Diversey Snapback 4 x 1 gallon per case
Spray Buff Removes scuffs, scratches and
black heel marks

44

Diversey Aquaria 5 gallon 20% Solids Green
Seal Floor Finish

NO BID

45

Diversey Neutralizer Easy Paks 2 x 90 tablets
per case Neutral Cleaner Loosens and removes
soil often found in high traffic areas while
protecting high gloss, high solids finishes

NO BID

Diversey Revive Plus SC J-Fill Revive® Plus

46  |SC is maintainer/rejuvenator formulated to 1 NO BID
clean floors and enhance gloss - 2 X 2.5 liters
Virex TB Disinfectant Cleaner, Lemon Scent,

47 |Liquid 32 ounce Flip Top Bottle, RTU, Sold 1 NO BID
by the case of 12 bottles. (Limited
Triple S Foamclean Lotion, Skin Cleanser,

48 |Sold by Case of 1 NO BID
6/1000ML

Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price

Buckeye General and Heavy-
Duty Cleaner: STRAIGHT-UP® pH neutral

49 lcleaner. i $47.85 $47.85
No-rinse formula. Safe on floor
finishes at any dilution. 5 Gallon
Buckeye General and Heavy-

50 Puty C%eaner: W QRKOUT@ - Ready-to-use, | $5.14 $5.14
heavy-duty muscle cleaner.
Spray and wipe. Patented. 1 Quart
Buckeye General and Heavy- Duty Cleaner:
WORKOUT® - Ready-to-use

l ’ : 1

. heavy-duty muscle cleaner. Spray and wipe. $65.01 $65.01
Patented. 5 Gallon B
Buckeye General and Heavy Duty Cleaner: X1 A

53 100™ - Heavy duty cleancr/degreaser. | e $13.7]

Excellent on equipment and concrete surfaces.

Patented. 1 Gallon




53

Buckeye General and I{eavy-

Duty Cleaner: XL-100™ - Heavy duty
cleaner/degreaser.

Excellent on equipment and concrete surfaces.
Patented. 5 Gallon

$62.29

$62.29

54

Buckeye General and Heavy-

Duty Cleaner: MARAUDER® -
Environmentally friendly,

all-purpose cleaner with

hydrogen peroxide. *Green Seal Certified. 5
Gallon

$84.54

$84.54

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

55

Buckeye Disinfectant Cleaner: LEMON
QUAT™, PINE QUAT™, OR MINT
QUAT™ -

One-step disinfectant, germicidal detergent,
germicidal detergent and deodorant. Lemon
fragrance. 1:64 dilution. HIV-1 (AIDS virus),
MRSA, and HBV/HCV

$13.71

$13.71

56

Buckeye Disinfectant Cleaner: SANICARE
TBX- A hospital grade,
disinfectant/cleaner/deodorizer. Kills TB, HIV-
1 (AIDS virus), HBV, HCV and Canine Parvo.
Ready-to-use. Patented. (EPA).

Quart 4.22
5 Gal 59.48

Quart 4.22
5 Gal 59.48

57

Buckeye Disinfectant Cleaner: SANICARE
WIPES — One step

cleaner, disinfectant and deodorizer. EPA
registered disinfectant kills 99% of bacteria in
15 seconds. 120 Large 7x8”

wipes per container

$64.55

$64.55

58

Buckeye Floor Finish Strippers:

LIQUID SHOVEL® - Mild pH

stripper formulated to provide excellent
results when used with cold water. For usc on
rubber and marmoleum flooring.

Patented. 5 Gallon

$110.83

$2.216.60

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price




59

Buckeye Floor Finish Strippers:
RIPSAW™ - Water-based stripper for floor
finishes and sealers. Features Automatic
Dilution Indicator (ADI)®.

Patented. 5 Gallon

$104.15

$104.15

60

Buckeye Floor Finish Strippers:

PENETRATE® - Environmental floor stripper

for finishes and sealers. Patented. Non-DOT
corrosive. *Green Seal Certified. 5 Gallon

$111.47

$111.47

61

Buckeye Carpet Care Products:
Carpet Cleaners: NAP-BAC™ - Dry foam
carpet shampoo. pH neutral. 1 Gallon
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62

Buckeye Carpet Care Products:
Carpet Cleaners: JET STREAM™ - Highly
concentrated and powerful extraction carpet

cleaner. Contains an odor eliminator. Woolsafe

approved. 1 Gallon

$19.08

$19.08

63

Buckeye Carpet Care Products:
Carpet Cleaners: DEFOAMT™ - Universal
defoamer for use in recovery tanks. 1 Gallon

$19.10

Buckeye Carpet Care Products: Carpet
Spotters: PATHFINDER™ - Combination
traffic lane cleaner and spot remover.
Woolsafe approved.

TANSAN

65

sl i op)

Buckeye Finishes:

CASTLEGUARD® - The King of Floor
Finishes™ - High solids metal interlock floor
finish. S Gallon

$130.64

$3,919.20

Buckeye Finishes: LIQUIMAX®
- Maximum durability finish. Microabrasion
and scuff resistant. 5 Gallon
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67

Buckeye Finishes: CITATION® -
Metal cross-link sealer/finish combination.

Easy application and bumishes with any
buffer. 5 Gallon

$111.49

$111.49

68

Buckeye Finishes: LUCENT™ - Water-based
urethane fortified floor finish. For resilient and
non-

resilient floors. 5 Gallon

$136.11

$136.11

69

Buckeye Clarion 25 with

MICROBAN - the first of its kind to utilize
Microban surface modification technology,
that embeds an EPA registered antimicrobial
into the floor finish. With this technology,
Clarion 25 provides live-on floor protection for
the finish’s usable life. Durable metal interlock
high solid, high gloss finish. -5

gallon

$92.40

$92.40

70

Buckeye Finishes: VERDE™ - Environmental
floor sealer/finish, zinc-free. *Green
Seal/Certified. 5 Gallon

10

$124.36

$1,243.60

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

il

Buckeye Enhancers and
Restorers: EQUITY™ - Ready- to-use spray
restorer for buffing and burnishing. 1 Quart

10

$6.38

$63.80

72

Buckeye Enhancers and
Restorers: EQUITY™ - Ready- to-use spray
restorer for buffing and burnishing. 1 Gallon

10

$20.39

$203.90

73

Buckeye Washroom Products: SANICARE
D.R.C.™ - A ready-

to-use, non-acidic Disinfectant Restroom
Cleaner designed for use on non-porous hard
surfaces. Kills HIV-1(AIDS Virus), Staph,
Strep and Athlete's Foot Fungus (EPA). 1

$3.39

$3.39

74

Buckeye Odor Control & Elimination:
SCAVENGER™ - Odor eliminator.
Concentrated formula. Floral fragrance. 1
Gallon

$20.70

$20.70




75

Buckeye Specialties: WORKOUT® WIPES -
Ready-

to-use, heavy-duty, muscle cleaner wipes.
Extra large 10"x12" wipes. 75 wipes per
container.

$104.74

$104.74

76

Buckeye Speciaities: STAR

SPRAY™ - Glass cleaner. Ready to- use
formula for all glass

surfaces. 1 Gallon

$7.61

$7.61

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

o

Buckeye Specialties: STAR SPRAY™
CONCENTRATE -

Concentrated glass cleaner.

*Green Seal Certified. 1 Gallon

$18.60

$18.60

78

Buckeye Specialties: 20027 - Chemical
restorer that professionally restores, polishes,
protects and beautifies vinyl, leather, rubber,

$13.60

$13.60

79

Buckeye Aerosols: STAR SPRAY™ - Glass
cleaner. Wipes away grime and dirt. 10 oz. can

$4.05

$4.05

80

Buckeye Aerosols: GLINTT™ - Stainless steel
and Formica® cleaner. 17 oz. can

$5.10

$5.10

81

Buckeye Aerosols: SCAVENGERT™ - Odor
eliminator designed to eliminate such malodors
as smoke and food. A true odor killer, not a

f) m~ ratal
deodorant or mask. 12 oz. can

$4.69

$4.69

82

o CQTMTM
Buckeye Aerosols: STATUS CLASSIC™: -

Lemon furniture polish for beauty and
protection. 18 oz. can FLORAL Scent Only
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Description

Unit Price

Total Price
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Buckeye Aerosols: BASE HIT™

- Baseboard stripping gel removes sealer and
floor finish buildup from baseboards, resilicut
tile and hard surface flooring. Patented. 18 oz.
can
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34

Buckeye Aerosols:
WORKOUTT™ - Aerosol heavy- duty muscle
cleaner. Patented. 180z. can

$5.55

$5.55

85

Buckeye Food Service Products:

DYSHT™ - High sudsing concentrated liquid
detergent for hand washing of dishes, pots,
pans, etc. Use with proportioner for greater
efficiency. 1 Gallon

$13.10

$13.10

86

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program: ECO
PRO PROPORTIONING SYSTEM
DISPENSER- Designed to be fully integrated,
the Eco Proportioning System is economical,
ecologically friendly, reliable, simple to use
and designed for your facility to achieve
maximum return on your investment. Holds up
to 6

$0.00

$0.00

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

87

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: ECO ELEMENT
PROPORTIONING SYSTEM

DISPENSER- ( A smaller version of the ECO
PRO) Designed to be fully integrated, the Eco
Proportioning System is econoinical,
ecologically friendly, reliable, simple to use
and designed for your facility to achieve
maximum return on your investment. Holds up
to 3

$0.00

$0.00

88

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CLEANERS: E11 All- Purpose Cleaner - is for
use on floors, walls, fixtures and other hard
surfaces where water is used. *Green Seal
Certified.

Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 84 gallous,

$121.10

$121.10




89

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CLEANERS: E12 Glass Cleaner HD - is a
dilutable glass cleaner for use on glass,
windows, mirrors, Plexiglass® and other
surfaces. * Green Seal Certified. Case of 4

bags. Each bag yiclds 5.25 gallons.

$85.25

$85.25

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

90

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: CLEANERS: E13 Multi-Purposc
Glass Cleaner - provides the most efficicnt
cleaning action and the best polishing without
streaking. Case of 4 bags. Each bag vyields 14

$86.42

$86.42

91

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: CLEANERS: E14 Muscle Cleaner -
is a spray and wipe, concentrated cleaner for
use on walls, fixtures, desks, lockers and other
hard surfaces where water is used. Buckeye
Eco Muscle Cleaner is effective on most types
of graffiti. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 2
gallons.

$93.18

$93.18

92

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CLEANERS: E15 Hydrogen Peroxide Cleaner
is a general purpose cleaner for use on hard
surfaces such as floors, walls, fixtures and

other surfaces where water may be safely used.

*Green Seal Certified. Case of 4 bags. Each
bag yields 84 gallons.

$96.11

$96.11

93

Buckeye Eco® Proportionin

Program: DISINFECTANT

Q 02

LEANERS: E22
One-Step

Disinfectant-Deodorizer Cleaner - is a heavy-
duty quaterary, cleaner, sanitizer, and
deodorizer. Case of 4 bags. Each

bag yields 84 gallons.

$186.65

$186.65

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price




94

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CLEANERS: E16 a Green Seal™ certified
concentrated foaming acid cleaner designed to
remove hard water deposits, standing water
rings, and soap scum buildup from multiple
surfaces. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 5.25
oallons.

$68.37

$68.37

95

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
DISINFECTANT CLEANERS: E23 Neutral
Disinfectant - is a multipurpose, neutral pH,
gemricidal detergent for use in hospital,
healthcare and industrial settings. Case of 4
bags. Each bag yields 84 gallons.

10

$85.14

$851.40

96

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
FLOOR CLEANER:

E31 pH Neutral Cleaner - is a super
concentrated floor cleaner for use on all types
of floors where water may be safely used.
*Green Seal Certified. Case of 4 bags. Each
bag yields 42 gallons.

10

$80.65

$806.50

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

97

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
FLOOR CLEANER:

E32 Floor Cleaner - is a super concentrated
floor cleaner for use on all types of floors
where water may be safely used. *Green Seal
Certified. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields169

$109.81

$109.81

98

Buckeye Eco E33: Buckeye Eco® Floor
Cleaner is a super concentrated floor cleaner
for use on all types of floors where water may
be safely used. Apply with an autoscrubber or
mop. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yiclds 169.4
gallons. This product is green certified.

$109.81

$109.81




99

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program: ODOR
CARE: E42 Eco Odor Counteractant is a
patented, liquid odor counteractant formulated
with exotic oils that chemically react on
contact with urine, feces, food waste, and other
foul edor substances to eliminate odors at their
sources. Case of 4 bags.
Each bag yields 21.5 gaiions.

$119.58

$119.58

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

100

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: ODOR CARE: E41 Odor Eliminator
- 1s a powerful, liquid odor eliminator that
engulfs foul smells on contact and prevents
their return. Its extended action continues to
conquer odors long after its fresh fragrance is
gone. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 5.25

$102.48

$102.48

101

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: CARPET CARE: E51

Carpet Spotter is a concentrated full spectrum
spotter which is effective on both oil and water-
based stains. E51 uses an encapsulation
technology to prevent re-soiling. Case of 4
bags. Each bag vyields 2.6 gallons.

$170.79

e
[
o

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CARPET CARE: E52

Eco Extraction Cleaner is highly concentrated
and designed to be used as a hot water carpet
extraction cleaner at 1 oz. per gallon. The
chemistry bonds wi il i

r\fl'\or- anil
Udivl svil

water-based soils, is low foaming, and leaves
no residue to promote the re-soiling of carpet
fibers. Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 42
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Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program:
CLEANERS: E61 Heavy Duty Cleaner is
highly concentrated and removes soils from
walls, floors, and fixtures as well as food
processing surfaces such as saws, grinders,
baking pans, grills, and ovens. It is formulated
for superior cleaning and soil suspension,
works in both hot and cold water, is NSF
registered, and Green Seal™ certified. Case of
4 bags. Each bag yields 14 gallons.

$78.10

$78.10

104

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning

Program: SANITIZER: E62

Sanitizer is super concentrated, and can be
used on walls, floors and fixtures. It is
approved for food processing and preparation
surfaces. EPA certified to deliver an accurate
sanitizing solution at a range of 150400 ppm.
Case of 4 bags. Each bag yields 168 gallons.

$66.04

$66.04

105

Buckeye Eco® Proportioning Program: ECO
SPRAY BOTTLES: Screenprinted bottles for
all Eco chemicals. Case of 12 Bottles. (Cannot
be mixed)

$50.00

$50.00

106

Trigger Sprayers for Screenprinted Bottles.
Case of 12

50

$25.00

$1,250.00

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

107

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:

HAND CLEANERS: Green

Certified Foaming Hand Wash: Green Seal™
Certified Hand Soap (Case of 6 x 1250ml)
*Dispensers at no charge with purchase of

50

$53.70

$2,685.00

108

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products: HAND
CLEANERS: Hair, Hand

and Body Foaming Wash: Green Scal™
Certified for Hair, Hands & Body - casc of 6 x
1250ml

*Dispensers at no charge with

$73.03

$73.03




109

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Foaming Hand Sanitizer: Hand
Sanitizer with Aloe & Vitamin E "contains
62% alcohol" (case of 6 x 1200ml)

*Dispensers at no charge with purchase of

$93.53

$93.53

110

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Foaming Hand Sanitizer Pump:
Hand Sanitizer with Aloe & Vitamin E
"contains 62% alcohol" (casc of 12 x 550ml)

$136.11

$136.11

111

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Foaming Hand Sanitizer Pump:
Hand Sanitizer with Aloe & Vitamin E
"contains 62% alcohol" (case of 24 x 50ml)

$78.01

$78.01

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

112

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Non-Alcchol Foaming Hand
Sanitizer: Hand Sanitizer with Allantoin &
Aloe (case of 6 x 1250ml)

[

o
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$64.65

i13

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand
Sanitizer Pump: Hand Sanitizer with Allantoin
& Aloe (case of 12 x 550ml)

$128.80

$128.80

114

Buckeye Symmetry™ Products:
SANITIZERS: Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand
Sanitizer Pump: Hand Sanitizer with Allantoin
& Aloe (case of 24 x 50ml)

45

$78.01

$3,510.45

Buckeye S_ymmetry Free Standing Floor Stand:
For use with Symmetry hand soap and
sanitizer dispensers. 51"high x 12" wide s 16"
deep. 38 Ib weighted base with adjustable feet.
Black or White

[y

$180.92

$180.92




Buckeye Reflections™ Products:
WATER-BASED

URETHANES: Arena 300 with Microban
technology. No mix formula, high gloss, low

- odor, burnishable wood floor coating. Contains 1 $412.19 $412.19
EPA approved antimicrobial component for
reducing overall bacterial load, mold and
mildew S Gallon
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
Buckeye Retlections™ Products:
WATER-BASED URETHANES: Gym Bond -
117 |1 45 $282.40 |$12,708.00
coat water based urcthane bonding agent for
maximum gym floor finish adhesion, VOC
Buckeye Reflections™ Products: OIL-
MODIFIED URETHANES:
118 |Coliseum™ 350 - Oil-Modified 60 $236.01 |$14,160.60
Wood Floor Coating 5 Gaiion
Buckeye Reflections™ Products: WOOD
FLOOR CLEANERS:
Screen Clean™ - ready-to-use cleaner for
119 [sealed wood floors prior to recoating or for [ $79.18 $79.18
tacking operations. It effectively removes dirt
and soil during the wet screen process leaving
no residue behind. 5 Gallon
Buckeye Reflections™ Products: WOOD
FLOOR CLEANERS:
Floortonic™ - gne-step cleaner and gloss
120 lrestorer for floor finish and wood floor 1 $22.71 $22.71
coatings. No polymers, doesn’t contribute to
buildup problems, and doesn’t requirc that the
floor be pre- cleaned. 1 Gallon
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
121 ACCESSORIES: Floor 1 $18.11 $18.11

Coater 18" Refills - Each




122

Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
ACCESSORIES: Floor
Coater 24" Refills - Each

$20.28

$20.28

123

Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
ACCESSORIES: Floor
Coater 18" Heavyweight

§51.13

$51.13

124

Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
ACCESSORIES: Floor
Coater 24" Heavyweight

$59.74

$59.74

125

Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
ACCESSORIES: Floor
Coater 18" Lightweight

$49.71

$49.71

126

Buckeye Reflections™ Products: T-BAR
ACCESSORIES: Floor
Coater 24" Lightweight

$58.30

$241,50
$5830

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

127

CARPET MATTING: 3M

Nomad, Dual Fiber, Backed Carpet Item #4000
with 4-sided edging. Designed for LIGHT
traffic conditions. The polypropylene loop pile
tuft construction eliminates and hides dirt and
moisture. Flexion Vinyl backing won't slain
the floor and helps prevent dirt and moisture
from reaching IL 3', 4' and 6' widths x custom
lengths up to 60'. Black, Gray, Brown. Price
by square foot.

6.60 sq ft

6.60 sq 1t

128

CARPET MATTING: 3M

Nomad, Dual Fiber, Backed carpet [tem #5000
with 4-sided edging. Designed for LIGHT
traffic conditions. Cross-rib, polypropylene
design scrapes off dirt and removes water.
Flexion Vinyl backing won't stain the floor and
helps prevent dirt and moisture {rom reaching
it. 3%, 4"and 6' widths x custom lengths up to
60", Black, Black-Gray, Blue, Brown, Gray and
Red.
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Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

129

CARPET MATTING: 3M

Nomad, Dual Fiber, Backed Carpet ltem
#6500 with 4-slded edging. Designed for
MEDIUM traffic conditions .

Polypropylene, checkerboard pattern scrapes
dirt and removes water. Flexion Vinyl backing
won't stain the floor and helps prevent dirt and
moisture from reaching it. 3", 4" and 6" widths
x custom lengths up to 60', Black, Brown,
Gray. Price by square foot.

10.70 sq ft

10.70 sq ft

130

CARPET MATTING: 3M

Nomad. Dual Fiber, Backed Carpet Item #8350
with 4-slded edging. Designed for HEAVY
traffic conditions. Random large diameter
polypropylene and small diameter nylon
pattern provides excellent dirt and water
removal. Allows sand, salt and dirt to hide
until It can be removed. Solution-dyed fibers
resist fading and staining.

Flexion Vinyl backing will not stain floor and
prevents dirt and moisture from reaching it.
Low profile allows foot, cart and wheelchair
traffic to move easily over the mat. 3', 4" and ¢’
widths x custom lengths up to 60"

10

13.59 sq ft

13.59 sq ft

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Logl

CARPET MATTING: 3M,

Super Nop 52, Backed Carpet. 100% Asota&
solution- dyed UV stabilized polypropylene
fibers with 20% post-consumer recycled
content. heavy weight pile and large nop
design provides outstanding scrubbing action.
Needle punch construction provides optimal
crush resistance. OxForce™ High Density
Rubber backing. Edges will not unravel or
fray. Withstands high traffic. custom widths up
to 13' x custom lengths up to 100". Dozens of
colors to choose from. Price by square {oot.

6.45 sq ft

6.45 sq ft




132

CARPET MATTING: Berber

Vinyl back, Backed Carpet Item, Super-
durable fibers. provide outstanding walk-clf
performance. Hobnail design provides
aggressive soil removal. Heavy-duty
SureTacnl vinyl back won't crack and ensures
flat, durable edges.100% Solution-Dyed UV
Stabilized polypropylene fibers with 15% post-
consumer recycled content. 3', 4' and 6' widths
x custom lengths up to 60'. Charcoal.
Rosewood Burgundy, Sterling Gray and
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Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

133

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #6050
Designed for MEDIUM traffic conditions
Vinyl loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and
moisture, minimizing re- tracking In to the
building.

Cushioned vinyl backing protects floors from
removed soil and will not stain flooring.
Durable vinyl construction performs in
temperatures from 10" to 150"F (-23°C to
65"C). Fade-resistant. Includes 4 sided heat
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134

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #6050
Designed for MEDIUM traffic conditions.
Vinyl loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and
moisture, minimizing re- tracking Into the
building.

Cushioned vinyl backing protects floors from
removed soil and will not stain flooring.
Purable vinyl ¢ i
temperatures from -10°F to 150"F (-23"C to
65"C). Fade-

B T = PO g
onstruction pertorms tn

$209.07

$209.07

Descrintion

Unit Price
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VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #6050
Designed for MEDIUM traffic conditions.
Vinyl loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and
moisture, minimizing re- tracking into the
building.

Cushioned vinyl backing protects floors [rom
removed soil and will not stain flooring.
Durable vinyl construction performs in
temperatures from -10°F to 150"F (-23"C to
65"C) Fade-

$229.52

$229.52

136

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #6050
Designed for MEDIUM traffic conditions.
Vinyl loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and
moisture, minimizing re- tracking into the
building Cushioned vinyl backing protects
floors from removed soil and will not slain
flooring. Durable vinyl construction performs
in temperatures from -10"F to 150" (-23°C to
65 C). Fade-

resistant. 3'and 4' widths x custom lengths up
to 60'. (Can be heat embossed up to 6', nosed
any length) Black, Brown and Gray. Price by

11.25sq ft

11.25 sq ft

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

137

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #6050
Designed for MEDIUM traffic conditions
Vinyl loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and
moisture. minimizing re- tracking Into the
building.

Cushioned vinyl backing protects floors from
removed soil and will not stain flooring.
Durable vinyl construction performs In
temperatures from 10"F to 150"F (-23-C to
55+¢). Fade- resistant. 3'and 4' widths x custom
lengths up to 60" (Can be heal cmbossed up to

16.08 sq ft

16.08 sq ft
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VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Unbacked Scraper Item #8100.
Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl
loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
minimizing re- tracking into the building. 0:1
and gre

- 1 - - = G e
e e izl L Ubileprkecsldopeama i an)

192.41 for

black brown
blue and gray

192.41 for

black brown
blue and gray

sweep cleanup. Includes heat embossed cdging el anl

on short sides. Black, Brown, Blue, Green, Red

and Gray.3'x 5'

Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
Description

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Unbacked Scraper Item #8100.

Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl $311.49 $311.49

loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture, black, brown, | black, brown,
139 |minimizing re- tracking into the building. Oil | gray gray

and grease resistant. Unbacked for casy lift and $848.00in | $848.00 in

sweep cleanup. Includes heat embossed edging blue, gree, red | blue, gree, red

on short sides. Black, Rrown, Blue, Green,

Red and Gray. 4' x 6'

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Unbacked Scraper [tem #8100.

Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl

loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
140 |Minimizing re- tracking into the building. Oil 1 14.04 sq ft | 14.04 sq ft

and grease resistant. Unbacked for easy lift and
sweep cleanup. (Can be heat embossed up to

6', nosed any leiigth) 3, 4' and 6' widths x
custorm lengths up to

60'. Black, Brown and Grav.

Description

Appr. Qty

Total Price




141

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Unbacked Scraper Item #8100.
Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl
loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
minimizing re- tracking Into the building. Oil
and grease resistant. Unbacked for easy lift and
sweep cleanup. (Can be heat embossed up to
6'.nosed any length) 3', 4' and 6' widths x
custom lengths up to 60". Blue, Green and Red.
PRiee

by square foot.

40.96 sq ft

40.96 sq ft

142

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed scraper Item #8150.
Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl
loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
minimizing re-tracking into the building. Oil
and grease resistant. Includes heal embossed
edging on all 4 sides. Black, Brown and Gray.

discontinued

discontinued

143

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper Item #8150.
Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl
loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
minimizing re- tracking into the building. Oil
and grease resistant. Includes heal embossed
edging on all 4 sides. Black, Brown and Gray.
4

x 6'

discontinued

discontinued

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

144

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Vinyl Loop, Backed Scraper [tem #8150.
Designed for HEAVY traffic conditions. Vinyl
loops scrape, trap and hide dirt and moisture,
minimizing re- tracking Into the building. Oil
and grease resistant. (Can be heat embossed up
to 6', nosed any length) 3', 4" and 6' widths x
custom lengths up to 60'. Black, Brown and
Gray. Price by square foot.

discontinued

discontinued
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VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Z web, Backed Scraper Item #6250. Designed
for MEDIUM traffic conditions . Peaked edge
design provides slip resistance while scraping
dirt and debris. Solid vinyl backing helps
protect floors and will not stain the floor,
Durable z-web construction provides excellent
support for light wheeled wraffic such as carts
and wheelchairs.

Traps and holds moisture for usc by drink
stations and water fountains. Heat embossed
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Description

Appr. Qty

=
o]

Unit Price

»

[¢8)

Total Pri
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VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Z-web, Backed Scraper Item #6250. Designed
for MEDIUM traffic conditions. Peaked edge
design provides slip resistance while scraping
dirt and debris Solid vinyl backing helps
protect floors and will not stain the floor.
Durable z-web construction provides excellent
support for light wheeled traffic such as carts
and wheelchairs.

Traps and holds moisture for use by drink

2 - . T
stations and water fountains. Heat embossed

$619.20

$619.20

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

.,
EaN

~]

VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad,

Z web, Backed Scraper Item #6250. Designed
for MEDIUM traffic conditions. Peaked edge
design provides slip resistance while scraping
dirt and debris. Solid vinyl backing liclps
protect floors and will not slain the floor.
Durable z-web construction provides excellent
support for light wheeled traffic such as carts
and wheelchairs.

Traps and holds moisture for use by drink
stations and water fountains.(Can be heat
embossed up to 6', nosed any length) Factory
edge on length. 3' and 4' widths x custom

airflan vasn $4 AN ™. 1. 1), v Qo
lch-_;ﬂ:.) ufr to Uv . DIACIK, OTOwI and ray,

p—et

25.80 sq ft
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VINYL MATTING: 3M Nomad

Z-web Unbacked Scraper Item #9100.
Designed for EXTREME traffic conditions.
Unbacked construction scrapes, traps and hides
dirt and debris, minimizing re-tracking into the
building.

Peaked edge design provides enhanced slip
resistance. Durable z-web construction
provides excellent support for light wheeled
traffic such as carts and wheelchairs. (Edging
Is not recommended) 2'and 3' widths x
custom lengths up to 50".

Black, Brown and Gray. Price by

$27.80

$27.80

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

149

3M™ 20" Scotch Brite Purple Diamond Pad.
Diamond coated pad for periodic maintenance
with low and high speed equipnient to help
bring floor to a high shine. 5 Per Box

$250.00

$250.00

150

Vinyl Matting: 3M 8100 Vinyl Looped
Unbacked scraper mat item #8100. Designed
for heavy traffic conditions. Oil and grease
resistant vinyl loops.

Black, brown, gray 3x5 and 4x6 with no
edging

Black, brown, gray 3' and 4' widths - up to 60'
length - priced

per square foot

*DUPLICA
TE - see
lines 138-
141

*DUPLICAT

E - see lines
138-141

151

3MT™ 27" Scotch Brite Purple Diamond Pad.
Diamond coated pad for periodic maintenance
with low and high speed cquipment to help
bring floor to a high shine. 5 Per Box

NO BID

NO BID

152

IMT™ Trizact™ Diamond TZ Discs 3.75" x 9" §

Gold, Red and Blue, 6 per box cach

NO BID

NO BID




handle, frame, backpack, tubing/valve
assembly, microfiber pad, {luid bag (one
gallon) & 5 spare

’7 S Rfizact B Emond 17, 725.68 7£5.08
151 |Abrasive Pads, 4 Pads per Carton, 4 Cartons | FwirL *WILL
per Case - Comes in Blue, Red or Gold BREAK A BREAK A
LA QO LA O
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
Scotchgard Stone Floor Protector. High
performance floor surface hardener and
154 protector for concrete, marbl@, granite, terrazzo ) $26407 $264.07
and other porous stone flooring. (to be used
with 3M Flat mop system)
3.785 liter. 1 bag
Unggr Excella Floor Finishing Straight Kit 18
inch Item #EFKT9 includes: 18 inch Mop Pad
155 : o 1
Holder, Pole with actuator, 20" Finishing Pad, $427.00 $427.00
one 1L bottle, backpack complete
156 | Unger 1L Excella Bottle Item # EFBTL 1 $20.00 $20.00
157 Unger Pole Item # EFPL4 with actuator 1 $195.00 $195.00
3M Scotchbrite Kitchen Cleaner and Degreaser
Wipes. ready-to- use, pre-moisiened
disposable wipes with a cleaner, degreaser and
Scotchgard™Protector. designed to clean,
158 ) : 1 NO BID NO BID
degrease, and protect stainless steel surfaces
and eliminate the risk of overspray. It is ideal
for cleaning non-food contact areas. Non-
woven PET fibers. 30wipes per pack/ 6 packs
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price |Total Price
3M Scotchbrite Professional 2-in- 1 Flat Mop
& Backpack Applicator Kit w/ Straight
159 Handle #20184. Contains telescoping straight I $435.69 $435.69




160

3M Scotch Brite Professional Flat Mop
#20192: Includes a

3.69" - 5.37" telescoping handle, 18" aluminum
trapezoid frame, 32 oz. detachable fluic bottle
and 18" microfiber flat mop pad. 1

per case

$237.09

$237.09

161

3M Scotchbrite Easy Clean disposable floor
mop pads. Engineered with the power of 3M™
Sorbents and blue scrubbing fibers to clean
floors and hold liquids. Hook and Loop
backing. 150/ 18” pads/case

NO BID

NO BID

162

3M Scotchbrite Professional 2-in- 1 Backpack.
Backpack holds floor finishes/protectors or
cleaning chemicals as part of the Scotch-
Brite™ Professional 2-in- 1 Flat Mop &
Backpack Finish Applicator

$75.00

$75.00

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

163

3M Scotchbrite Professional Flat Mop Bottles
32 oz. (946.3 mL) detachable fluid bottle
converts a Scotch-Brite™ Professional 2-in- 1
Backpack Finish Applicator to a flat wet mop.
Use with any cleaning fluid you choose.
10/case

NO BID

NO BID

164

3M Scotchbrite Professional 2-in- 1 one gallon
refillable fluid bags. Reusable/washable bags
fit snuggly in the backpacks of the Scotch-
Brite Professional 2-in-1 Backpack Finish
Applicator to hold floor finish/protectors or
cleaning chemicals. 5/case

$90.00

$90.00

165

Scotchguard™ Floor Protector
Applicator Pad, Blue, 18 in., 1/per bag -
#59640

Ll

$13.19

166

3M Scotchgard Protect & Shine
Floor Protector, | Gallon Bag

$85.07

$85.07




el i 2.5GAL:$267.3|2.5GAL:$267.3
1 <+ |Paily Floor Enhancer: Comes in i 0 G
2.5 Gallon and a 32 ounce doser bottle (6 per 3207:$160.20 | 3207:3160 20
case)
3M Glass Cleaner and Protector - #50982
Scotchgard™ Protection that makes it more
168 leffective at removing fingerprints, i $5.57 $5.57
lipstick—even permanent marker. Fast drying
and streak free. | QUART
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
169 13M Brand Floor Pad 13" SPP Surface
Preparation Pad - cach disc : $5.81 $5.81
3M Brand Floor Pads 13" Black, Blue, Red,
170 [White 5 of each color per case 1 $19.23 $19.23
171 [3M Brand Floor Pad 13" Clean
& shine Pad 5 per case 1 $58.01 $58.01
3M Brand Floor Pad 14" SPP
172 |Surface Preparation Pad - each disc 1 $5.89 $5.89
173 |3M Brand Floor Pad 14" Clean i} J— e
& Shine Pad - 5 per case £ $65.60 $65.60
174 |3M™ Easy Trap Duster, 8 in x 6
in X 125 ft, Roll 1/case 1 $57.71 $57.71
175 [3M™ 20" Surface Preparation . .
Pad - cach disc E $10.88 $10.88
3M Brand Floor Pad 13" Surface Preparation “
i Pad - cach disc : $5.81 $5.81
AM Twist n Fill Dispensing System: #24 3 i.“—
177 {1 Floor Cleaner - 137 end usc gailons per 1 $66.00 $66.00
liter bottle




178 [3M Twist n Fill Dispensing System: #52 Tile
Grout and Bowl Cleaner - 2.6 end use gallons 1 $36.79 $36.79
per 2 liter bottle

Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price

3M Brand Floor Pads 20" Black, Blue, Red,

17 White, Tan, Aqua 5 per case of each color : $38.55 $38.55
3M Brand Floor Pads 20" Pink, Topline, Sky

180
Blue 5 per case of each color : $43.03 $43.03
3M Brand Floor Pads 20" Black Hi Pro 7300

1 1 $72.71 $72.71
Pads S per case
3M Brand Floor Pads 17" Black Hi Pro 7300

182 1 $56.04 $56.04
Pads 5 per case
3M Brand Floor Pads 13" Blue, Red, White 5

183fF : 1 $19.23 $19.23
per case of each color
3M Brand Floor Pads 17" Black,

Le Blue, Red, White 5 per case of each color i $29'77 $29'77
3M Brand Floor Pads 27" Pink, Topline, Sk

185 ) g 1 $95.62 $95.62
Blue 5 per case of each color
M Brand Floor Pads 27" White, Tan, Aqua 5

186 |7 : ! 2 1 $83.52 $83.52
per case of each color

187 [3M Easy Trap Flip Holder 4"x23" cach Il $69.25 $69.25
3M Easy Il Holder 4"x 17" cach (to be used

i 1

- with 3M Easy Trap Duster) $44'09 $44'09
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price

3M Easy II Holder 4"x35" cach (to be used

il with 3M Easy Trap Duster) : $52.61 $52.61
3M Easy IT Holder 4"x47" each (to be used

Bl with 3M Easy Trap Dusler) 1 $56.88 $56.88
3M Easy Il [{older 4"x59" cacl

191 o e L $79.70 $79.70

(1o be used with 3M Easy Trap Duster)




3M Doodleduster Holder 25"
each (to be used with 3M Easy Trap Duster)

fum—

193

3M Doodleduster Holder 38"
each (to be used with 3M Easy Trap Duster)

e T
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Gateway Trash Can Liners: Unique
formulation of Hexcne Resins, Star scaled,
perforated, coreless rolls made in the USA.
Testing done on every 30th bag pulled:
Multi-Directional Strength, Testing
(Tensile), 3 Separate Tear Tests, Variable
Speed, Puncture Testing, Calibrated Burst
and Seal Testing, and Max Weight Testing.
All cases labeled with COMPLETE
information.

Contains no recycled content = less plastic
nceded to make each liner = less plastic into

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

195

40 x 48 High Density 14 MIC

250 rolls/case (10 rolls of 25) Black or Clear x
48 High Density 18MIC 250 rolls/case (10
rolls of 25) Black or Clear

$48.71

$48.71

196

33x40 High Density 14 MIC 250
rolls/case (10 rolls of 25) Clear

$33.54

$33.54

38x60 high Density 16 MIC 200
rolls/case (8 rolls of 25) Clear

$51.12

$51.12

—
O
o2

24 x 32 High Density 6 MIC
1000 rolls/case (20 rolls of 50) Black or Clear

o
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200

40 x 50 R Spec Linear Low 1.4 MIL 100

rolls/case ( 4 rolls of 25) Black

$48.16

$48.16




201

33 x 39 R Spec Linear Low 1 MIL 100
rolls/case ( 4 rolls of 25) Black

$28.17

$28.17

23 x 31 R Spec Linear Low .6
MIL 500 rolls/case (10 rolls of 50) Black

$47.19

$47.19

203

36.5x49 R Spec Linear Low 1 MIL 150 rolls/
case (6 rolls of 25) Black or Clear

$61.53

$61.53

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

204

43x47 R Spec Lincar Low | MIL 100 rolls/
case (4 rolls of 25)
Black

$43.37

$43.37

205

12 x 21 High Density 22 MIC
Feminine Hygiene Container Liner 1000/cs
Red, Black or Clear

$48.16

$48.16

206

12 x 21 High Density 22 MIC
Feminine Hygiene Container Liner 1000/case

Red, B+Black or Cleary"DUPLICATE OF 205
(ABOVE

$48.16

DUPLLLATE

$48.16

207

Peladow Calcium Chloride - 50
pound bag

50

$25.00

$25.00

Karcher Equipment

208

Karcher Chariot 2 iScrub 20" Deluxe Stand On
Floor Scrubber with 10 gallon solution and
recovery tank and automatic charger w/pad
driver. Aqua- Mizer Technology

$10,438.92

$10,438.92

209

Karcher Chariot 3 iScrub 26"

Stand On Floor Scrubber w/ 25 gal soltuion/28
gal recovery tanks. Sell Charger with pad
driver. Aqua Mizer Technology

and EcoMode.

$16,592.49

$16,592.49

Karcher Chariot 2 iGloss 20" Stand On Floor
Burnisher (small platform) - 2000rpm with
automatic charger and pad driver

$15,812.46

$15,812.46
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Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price |Total Price
211 |Karcher Chariot 2 iScrub 20 with Orh
arcner ario I>CIh with (h 1 $11,18043 $11,18043
Technology
Karcher Clipper Duo Carpet Extractor and
212 [Encapsulating Machine- 16" cieaning path, 10 I $5,802.61 $5,802.61
gallon capacity, on board cleaning tools and
213 |Karcher Admiral 8 Carpet Extractor - 8 gallon
: : . : 1 - .
capacity, 15" cleaning path, brush assist drive $4’O33 63 | $4,033.63
Karcher Clipper 12 Carpet
214 |Extracior - 12 gallon capacity, 18" cleaning I $4,979.51 $4,979.51
path, brush assist drive
Karcher Armada BRC 40/22 steerable 16"
gl walk behind extractor . $4’920'40 $4’920'4O
Karcher Presto 3 Mini Extractor and Spotter- 2
216 |gallon capacity, 55 psi, standard hand tool 1 $1 01409 | § 1,014.09
Karcher Puzzi 10/1 Extractor with Spray Wand
217 |- 2.6 gallon solution/ 2.4 recovery tanks, 1 $1,368.80 $1 ,368.80
adjustable upright spray wand, hand wand
Karcher AB 84 Air Blower with handle and
218 |wheels, 1600 rpm, 1/2 hp 1 $401.09 $401.09
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
Karcher Sensor XP Upright
Vacuum 12" - SRXP12 - auto height adjust,
219 lelectronic control system, 2 year warr brush | $707.59 $707.59
and motor, lifetime on belts
Karcher Sensor XP Upright
Vacuum 15" - SRXP15- auto height adjust,
220" lelectronic control system, 2 vear warr brush 1 $R95.R6 $895.86




Karcher Sensor XP Upright Vacuum 18" -
SRXP18- auto height adjust, clectronic control
system, 2 year warrt brush and

motor, lifetime on belts

$986.81

$986.81

222

Karcher Sensor XP Dust Bags -pkg of 10

$33.65

223

Karcher Sensor S2 HEPA
Upright Vacuum [2"

$633.67

$633.67

Karcher Sensor S2 HEPA
Upright Vacuum 14"

$788.54

$788.54

225

Karcher New Wave Wide Area
Vacuum -26"- dual 26" counter rotating
brushes, floating brush deck Item # CV66

$5,202.34

$5,202.34

226

Karcher NT 48/1 - 13 Gallon wet dry vac with
hose and tools.

$526.60

$526.60

PO

Karcher Recover 18 Gallon Wet/Dry Vac with
front mounted squeegee with hose and wand
[tem # NT68/1.

$1,264.20

$1,264.20

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

228

Karcher NT50/1 TACT TE Edt/Dry Vac 13.5
gallon with 13 ft. hose, tools and HEPA filter
to fully comply with OSHA silica dust

regulations. Self cleaning TACT system filter.

$1,236.22

$1,236.22

229

Karcher Vac Pac Portable back
HEPA Vacuum - 6 quart with hose and tool kit
- crgonomic harness system.

$773.98

$773.98

230

Karcher Vac Pac Portable back HEPA Vacuum
- 10 quart with hosc and tool kit - ergonomic
harness system.

$817.64

$817.64




Karcher BV 5/1 BP Battery Back Pack Vac
with 36 volt lithium ion battery and 120 V
quick charger and tools.

$1,332.42

$1.332.42

Karcher KM 70/30 C BP ADV 28" Sweeper -
electronteally driven- active dust control, 11

gallon capacity, incl right side broom

I
)
)
i~
b
W
-

Karcher KM 75/40 W BP 30"

Sweeper - battery driven with on board
charger, self propelled w/ 400 watt drive
motor, 11 gallon capacity

$7,567.04

$7,567.04

Karcher KM 90/60 R ADV36"
Ride-On Sweeper - with one side broom, 2
hoppers

$23,989.40

$23,989.40

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

[N
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wn

Karcher KM 150/500 R LPG

Ride on Propanc Sweeper, LPG powered fully
hydraulic industrial indoor/outdoor sweeper
with three-wheel rear steering. For heavy duty
applications. Working width has 1 or 2 59”
brushes, waste container capacity of 132

f—

$90,768.79

©o
\O
-
~J
N
@]
~J
Ne)

24
00

Karcher KM 130/300 R LPG Ride on Propane
Sweeper, LPG powered fully hydraulic
industrial indoor/outdoor sweeper with three-
wheel rear steering. For heavy duty
applications. Working width has 1 or 2 517
brushes, waste container capacity of 81

Karcher KM 125/130 R BP Industrial Ride On

AGM Ratteries

Ba‘tpr}’ S""’nnnp‘ ANJLYL LJAaciulivo

Clocwin
167 CepLr, , LaCCUil

drive system with vacuum. Patented Tact filter

cleaning cnsures dust-{ree work. Working
Ihna (s ETIP9

: N r] I | P NI i
B2 O RS fion oS (G SnlTNS GRS, SAEte

container capacity

$47,287.58

$47,287.58

Description

Unit Price

Total

~
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238

Karcher KM 105/180 R BP, 2RSB Industrial
Ride On Battery Sweeper with AGM 285 Ah
Batteries, and (raction drive system with
vacuum. Patented Tact filter cleaning ensures
dust- free work. Working width has two 577
side brushes, waste container capacity of 29

$38,149.24

$38,149.24

239

Karcher PS 4/7 BP Mister - Baltery operated
hospital grade misting system. Designed for
use with Vital Oxide disinfectant. 8 hour

continuous spray time. Portable with wheels.

$375.91

$375.91

Vital Oxide hopsital disinfectant -

EPA registered to kill harmful bacteria, mold
and mildew, deodorizes and eliminates
allergens. SAFE FOR MISTING. Can be used
on food surfaces and carpets. 4x1 gallon, 5
gallon and 55 gallon drum

4X1:$194.73
5 GAL:
$233.08 55
GAL:
$1740.71

4X1:5194.73
5 GAL:
$233.08 55
GAL:
$1740.71

241

Karcher BR30/4 C 12" Electric Floor
MicroScrubber - 1 gallon solution and
recovery tanks, 1 cylindrical brush and 2

$2,191.89

$2,191.89

242

Karcher BR40/10 C ADV 16" Floor Scrubber -
electric operation, 2 counter rotating brushes
and 2 squeegees. 2.5 gallon tank

$4,565.69

$4,565.69

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

243

Karcher BR 35/12 C BP 14"

Floor Scrubber - 18" vac width, 3/ 3 gallon
fresh water/ waste water, roller brushes, can
clean adjacent to wall at 90 degree angle. Can
also work in reverse. Lithium Ion Battery.

$5,934.49

$5,934.49

244

Karcher BD 30/4 C BP Compact
Scrubber - 11" disc brush with vacuum, only
44 lbs, 36V battery with charger.

$3,060.46

$3,060.46

o
AN
wn

Karcher BD 50/50 C Classic BP

20 disc scrubber — slim design works well for
larger jobs in tight spaces, 13.2 gallon
(resh/dirty tank sizes, 24V/105 Ah wet

SIRAIONIG

$3,519.76




246

Karcher BD 70/75 - 28" walk- behind
scrubber. Easy to operate controls allows for
quick fraining and operation. Adjustable brush
pressure for much greater flrexibility for
cleaning on all types of floors. With up to 200

Ibs of down pressure. 20 gal solution and

rccovery tanks. 185 Ah wel batteries, shelf

$9,716.35

$9,716.35

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Karcher B 150 R Bp Industrial Ride On
Scrubber Drier, R 75 cylindrical scrub Deck,
36V 312 Ah AGM Batteries with shelf
charger, working width brushes 307, 40 gallen
fresh and dirty water tank capacities, traction

$31,776.43

$31,776.43

248

Karcher B 250 R Bp Industrial Ride On
Scrubber Drier, R 100 cylindrical scrub Deck,
36V 335 Ah AGM Batteries with shelf
charger, working width brushes 39”, 66 gallon
fresh and dirty water tank , traction drive.

$45,285.07

$45,285.07

Karcher Lightning 51/2000 Cord Electric
Burnisher - 2000rpm, 20" burnishing path,
dust control, 1.5 hp, floating handleand
flexible pad driver

$2,592.07

$2,592.07

250

Karcher Lightning BDP 50/2000 W - 20" Dust
Control Battery Powered Commercial
Bumisher

$10,504.72

Karcher 27” Lightning Propane burnisher with
18 hp Kawasaki engine with EPA and CARB
Certified Low Emission Fuel System.

Variable pad pressure with adjustable wheels,

tilt back design.

$6,480.19
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Karcher SG1 C Bp Backpack Gum Remover:
Removes gum in 4-6 scconds and is safe to use
on stone, concrete and even carpet. Powered by
a single lithium 1on battery, this gum remover
is quiet and offers up to 8 hours of
uninterrupted operation. No cords or water
requircd. Run time of 4 hours. No harsh
residue, safc on all surfaces.

Quick change brushes for case of use and
maintcnance. Low pressure fuel canisters are
designed to ensure delivery of proper fuel

$3,733.49

$3,733.49

Karcher Radiant with Orb Technology — 177
cleaning path with 4.75 gallon solution tank
for carpet, stripping, stone. Orbital agitation
with dual action vibration and rotation.

$4,456.55

$4,456.55

Karcher Bolt 17" BDS 43/175C Floor Machine
- 175 rpm, 1.5 hp with pad driver

$1,477.91

$1,477.91

Karcher Bolt 20" BDS 51/175C
Floor Machine- 175 rpm, 1.5 hp with pad

driver

$1,514.31

$1,514.31

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

Karcher SG 4/4 Stcam Cleaner with cart - 2
tank system, incl. stcam gun, extension tube,
floor nozzle, carpet adaptor, cloth set, hand
nozzle, circular brush, spot nozzle, fill funnel

$2,328.32

$2,328.32

Karcher Jarvis Serics 11073800 Surface
Cleaner/Pressure Washer. cold water surface
cleaner pressure washer is an all- in-one unit
with the pump and engine attached to the
surface

$2.687.57

$2,687.57

]
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Karcher B40 W BP with Orb. 20” walk behind
floor scrubber , traction drive, disc scrub deck,
24v/105 AH wet batteries, curved squeegee

$9,286.54

$9,286.54
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Karcher BD 80/100 W Bp Classic. 327
cleaning path, 26 gallon tank, traction drive
walk behind auto scrubber with wet batteries

$10,086.19

$10,086.19
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Karcher KM 85/50 R BP Sweeper — working
width of 67" hydraulic front-wheel drive,

unique swecping crescent brush, fully

automati ancint filter cleaning system

~ i BT
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using blasts of compressed air. Has wet

$11,369.34

$11,369.34

Description

Appr. Qty

Unit Price

Total Price

261

Karcher Compass 2 AP100/50M Multi Surface
Cleaner with pressurc washer, wet/dry vac, 30'
flex hose, adjustable spray gun, 29 gallon
solution/ 19 gallon recovery tanks.

) DB i

$5,957.22

262

Karcher Compass Shine concentrated
bathroom cleaner/deodorizer. 1 Gallon (to be
used with Karcher Compass 2 machine)

$34.68

$34.68

263

Karcher HD Sertes Electric
Power Washer — HD 2.0/1000 Ed, Low profile
handie and compact footprint for easy
maneuverability. Corrosion resistant aluminum
converts from cart to skid, flat free tires, direct
drive, 120V 15amp, 1.5 HP. Includes gun,
hose, lance, red, yell, green, white and nozzles.
Additional Rotary nozzle included with hose

storage hook and handle with hose reel.

$2,377.57

$2,377.57

Description

Appr. Qt

A%

‘(atf‘Hc' HD Serics

f\\XIPI"P{‘]
(ORI 2 8 V10 8
1

COUUsiOu [esis eight aluminum
cart or Skld flat free

tires, direct drive, 196 cc engine with recoil

frame, can be used as a

stari. luciudes gun, hose iance, handie and
coupler. Added Easy Force trigger gun and
Nozzle with storage hook and handle with

N T

$2,255.75




Karcher 11D Scrics Gas Power Washer — HD
4.0/40 GeB, Honda powered, corrosion
resistant and light weight aluminum frame, can
be used as a cart or skid, flat free tires, direct

w drive, 389 cc engine with electric start. ! $4,003.59 $4,003.59
Includes gun, hose lance, handle and coupler.
Added Easy Force trigger gun and Nozzle with
storage hook and handle with hose reel.
E-Mist EPIX360
TruElectrostatic™ Cordless electrostatic hand
266 held spmyef.‘P_ortable, p_owerful, durable and 1 $1 1 65.50 | $1.1 65.50
an even, uniform and wraparound layer of gern4
kiling power up to 4,000 high-touch point sq.
ft. Item No. E099
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price
E-Mist® EX-7000™ TruElectrostatic Cordless
267 |electrostatic backpack sprayer. 1 year warranty. 1 $2,695.5O $2,695.50
Item No. E0999- 11
Bioshield 75 Biostatic Surface Protectant:
Ready to use approved Bacteriostatic,
Fungistatic and Algaestatic. Quart: $323.46 | Quart: $323.46
268 Odorless, colorless, durable antimicrobial that 1 Gallon: $287.82|Gallon: $287.82
bonds with almost any surface to inhibit 55 Gall: 55 Gall:
growth of bacteria for up to 3 months. Comes $3858.52 $3858.53
in quart, gallon
and 55 gallons.
Bioshield 5000C Biostatic Surface Protectant:
Super Concentrated, FDA approved 5GAL: $682.20|5GAL: $682.20
269 |Bacteriostatic, Fungistatic and Algaestatic. 1 55 GAL: 55 GAL:
Comes in 5 gallons Item No. L019-111 and 55 $7017.12 $7017.12
gallons drum Item No. LOO9
Solaris LoCor Mechanical Hands Free Paper $25 (OR NO $25 (OR NO
270 Towel Dispenser #68006 Black | CHARGE CHARGE
WITH PAPER | WITH PAPER
PURCHASE | PURCHASE




Solaris LoCor Econecmy Hard Wound White
Roll Towel # 46898 - 7' x 850" Full Embossed,

271 ply 6 rolls/case l )0 e G $07/.02
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price |[Total Price
Solaris LoCor Jumbo Toilet Paper Towel $25 (OR NO | $25 (ORNO
279 Dispenser #67033 Black I CHARGE CHARGE
WITH PAPER | WITH PAPER
PURCHASE | PURCHASE
273 |Solaris LoCor Jumbo Bath White Tissue
#26822 3.3" x 1200 plain
emboss, 2 ply 12 rolls/case : $120.00 $120.00
Novalent Shield+ Advanced Antimicrobial
274 |Hand Sanitizer - 500 mL pumps 6 per case. 1 $278.00 $278.00
275 |White Wettask Hydroknit Wipers 12"x12.5",
for use with solvents & detergents. Buckets are S
no charge 1 NO BID NO BID
Kleenex Luxury Pik Foam Hand Soap
w/Moisturizers, 1000 ml, high capacity, easy-
276 tg—load, bottle is. recycable when finished, 1 NO BID NO BID
dispensers provided at no charge
Ecolab Fpro6100265 Facilpro
277 |Heavy Duty Low Odor Stripper 1/2.5 Gallon 1 NO BID NO BID
Ecoluad Fpro61001033 Facilpro Bright Blast
278 |Low Odor Stripper 1 NO BID NO BID
1/5 Gallon
Ecoiab Fpro6101130 Facilpro L
279 IMAXX Durable Florr Stripper 1/2.5 Gallon 1 NO BID NG BID
Description Appr. Qty | Unit Price | Total Price




