

EASTERN SUFFOLK BOCES COOPERATIVE BIDDING PROGRAM

Bid 2020-009-0204 Custodial Equipment (Catalog Purchase)
The Term of Contract is from April 1, 2020 through March 31, 2021

Requisition

Location

Attention

No.

Date

Amount

-

Line	List Price	Latest Edition Month & Year	Alternate	Item Description	Discount	Awarded Vendor	Extension
00001		1/1/2020		Advance - Equipment only	20.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00002		1/1/2020		Advance - Parts	20.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00003				Betco - Equipment only	0.00%	No Bid/ No Award	-
00004				Betco - Parts	0.00%	No Bid/ No Award	-
00005		January 2020		Clarke - Equipment only	21.10%	Emerald Island Supply Company, Inc.	-
00006		Clarke January 2020		Clarke - Parts	10.00%	Nilfisk, Inc.	-
00007		Jan 1, ,2020		Graco - Equipment Only	40.00%	The Sherwin-Williams Co.	-
00008		Jan 1, ,2020		Graco - Parts	40.00%	The Sherwin-Williams Co.	-
00009		Jan-20		Pioneer - Equipment Only	0.00%	Pioneer Manufacturing Company	-
00010		Jan-20		Pioneer - Parts	0.00%	Pioneer Manufacturing Company	-
00011		1/10/2020		Rubbermaid - Equipment only	45.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00012		1/10/2020		Rubbermaid - Parts	45.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00013		1/1/2020		Taski- Electric Machines Only	20.10%	Sterling Sanitary Supply Corp.	-
00014		1/1/2020		Taski- Battery Machine & Parts	15.10%	Sterling Sanitary Supply Corp.	-
00015				Tennant- Electric Machines Only	0.00%	No Bid/ No Award	-
00016				Tennant- Battery Machine & Parts	0.00%	No Bid/ No Award	-
00017		1/1/2020		Triple S - Equipment only	25.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00018		1/1/2020		Triple S - Parts	25.00%	I. Janvey & Sons, Inc.	-
00019		1/1/2020	all products except: -Chariots 10% -All sit down scrubbers and sweepers -5% -Industrial Vacs- 5%	Windsor - Equipment Only	15.00%	Ocean Janitorial Supply Inc.	-
00020		1/1/2020		Windsor - Parts	15.00%	Ocean Janitorial Supply Inc.	-
00021		January 2020		Viper-Equipment Only	17.00%	Emerald Island Supply Company, Inc.	-
00022		1/1/2020		Viper-Parts	20.10%	Sterling Sanitary Supply Corp.	-